
[DON CARLSON [TOM]] VOLVO PENTA 3940019250 - STARBOARD IPS
Sample No: VPA058237
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 75W90

ADMIRALTY MARINE2775 KURTZ ST, STE 12SAN DIEGO, CAUS  92110Contact: Terry AlbeeTALBEE@ADMIRALTYMARINE.NETT: F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. Werecommend that you drain the oilfrom the component if this has notalready been done. We recommendan early resample to monitor thiscondition.Gear wear is indicated.There is a moderate concentration ofwater present in the oil. The oil is nolonger serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: VP151529Unique No: 10940041Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 25 Mar 2024
Report Id: VP151529 [WUSCAR] 06125890 (Generated: 03/26/2024 13:13:14) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Terry Albee - VP151529

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA058237 VPA026320 --- ---Sample Date 20 Mar 2024 26 Jun 2020 --- ---Machine Hours 324 198 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 107 107 --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % 0.400 NEG --- ---Silicon ppm 12 13 --- ---Sodium ppm 39 2 --- ---Potassium ppm 1 <1 --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 18 18 --- ---Iron ppm 229 17 --- ---Copper ppm 23 2 --- ---Lead ppm 0 <1 --- ---Tin ppm 0 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm 5 <1 --- ---Chromium ppm 1 <1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 --- ---Nickel ppm 3 0 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 6 <1 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 9 12 --- ---Magnesium ppm 4 5 --- ---Zinc ppm 49 8 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1413 1274 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 249 295 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP151529 [WUSCAR] 06125890 (Generated: 03/26/2024 13:13:16) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Terry Albee - VP151529
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 3940019250\Starboard IPS [VPA058237] 20 Mar 2024 @ 324.0 hrs

