
[MICHAEL MAGNAN] ZF IRM220A1 91-7644 - INBOARD - STARBOARD GEARBOX
Sample No: VPA051552
Oil Type: {unknown}

Northwest Diesel Power1325 ROEDER AVE SUITE 103BELLINGHAM, WAUS  98225Contact: BRANDON ROBERTSONparts@nwdieselpower.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.The leadlevel has decreased, but is stillabnormal. All other component wearrates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VP759009Unique No: 10940868Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 26 Mar 2024
Report Id: VP759009 [WUSCAR] 06126717 (Generated: 03/29/2024 09:28:43) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRANDON ROBERTSON - VP759009

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA051552 VPA060556 --- ---Sample Date 23 Mar 2024 17 Feb 2024 --- ---Machine Hours 0 1629 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd --- ---Sample Status ATTENTION SEVERE --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 90.0 91.6 --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % NEG NEG --- ---Silicon ppm 11 7 --- ---Sodium ppm 25 77 --- ---Potassium ppm 1 8 --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 16 21 --- ---Iron ppm 15 26 --- ---Copper ppm 127 510 --- ---Lead ppm 71 274 --- ---Tin ppm 1 3 --- ---Aluminum ppm 1 2 --- ---Chromium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 44 45 --- ---Nickel ppm 0 0 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 0 0 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 3447 3068 --- ---Magnesium ppm 20 34 --- ---Zinc ppm 1139 1086 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1031 911 --- ---Barium ppm 0 1 --- ---Boron ppm 338 67 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP759009 [WUSCAR] 06126717 (Generated: 03/29/2024 09:28:45) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRANDON ROBERTSON - VP759009
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	ZF ZF IRM220A1 91-7644 - INBOARD\Starboard Gearbox [VPA051552] 23 Mar 2024 @ .0 hrs

