
[WINDSERVE MARINE [004]] VOLVO PENTA 3950010290 - PORT IPS
Sample No: VPA036185
Oil Type: VOLVO SYNTHETIC GEAR

STEWART AND STEVENSON (ADDA)PO BOX 950LODI, NJUS  07644Contact: DAVID TAGLIERId.taglieri@kirbycorp.comT: (508)263-5502F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. (sample post gear failure,loss of reverse on drive unit).Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VP166699Unique No: 10950542Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 01 Apr 2024
Report Id: VP166699 [WUSCAR] 06131077 (Generated: 04/01/2024 12:49:22) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVID TAGLIERI - VP166699

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA036185 --- --- ---Sample Date 18 Mar 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 2050 --- --- ---Oil Hours 407 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 102 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 6 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 29 --- --- ---Iron ppm 49 --- --- ---Copper ppm 3 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 17 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 34 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 11 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 0 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1272 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 288 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP166699 [WUSCAR] 06131077 (Generated: 04/01/2024 12:49:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVID TAGLIERI - VP166699
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 3950010290\Port IPS [VPA036185] 18 Mar 2024 @ 2050.0 hrs

