
ZF 20241583 - INBOARD - STARBOARD GEARBOX
Sample No: VPA036423
Oil Type: {unknown}

Qualtiy Boats3340 Placida RoadENGLEWOOD, FLUS  34224Contact: JASON HOGANJHOGAN@QUALITYBOATS.COMT: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. Please specify the brand,type, and viscosity of the oil on yournext sample.All component wearrates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VP414527Unique No: 10953158Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 03 Apr 2024
Report Id: VP414527 [WUSCAR] 06133693 (Generated: 04/03/2024 11:16:19) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JASON HOGAN - VP414527

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA036423 --- --- ---Sample Date 25 Mar 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 501 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 128 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 2 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 16 --- --- ---Iron ppm 13 --- --- ---Copper ppm 55 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 98 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 2874 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 42 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1181 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1109 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 3 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP414527 [WUSCAR] 06133693 (Generated: 04/03/2024 11:16:21) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JASON HOGAN - VP414527
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	ZF ZF 20241583 - INBOARD\Starboard Gearbox [VPA036423] 25 Mar 2024 @ 501.0 hrs

