
[ST FRANCIS YACHT [ST. FRANCIS YACHT]] VOLVO PENTA 2204406822 - PORT COOLANT
Sample No: VPA060742
Oil Type: {unknown}

Helmuts Marine Service619 Canal StreetSAN RAFAEL, CAUS  94901-3545Contact: NADINE URCIUOLISERVICE@HELMUTSMARINE.COMT:  x:F:  x:

Diagnosis

We recommend drain/flush system,and refill with 50/50 antifreeze watermixture. We advise that you replenishthe supplemental coolant additives(SCAs) and add per manufacturer`srecommendations. There is a lightconcentration of oil present in thecoolant. Carboxylate test failed. Theglycol level is lower than acceptable.The pH level of this fluid is within theacceptable limits.

Depot: VP152741Unique No: 10953239Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 03 Apr 2024
Report Id: VP152741 [WUSCAR] 06133774 (Generated: 04/03/2024 14:54:42) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: NADINE URCIUOLI - VP152741

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA060742 --- --- ---Sample Date 22 Mar 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1500 --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITION

pH Scale 0-14 7.82 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm 600 --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 33.8 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C NT --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Coolant Appearance oil --- --- ---Coolant Color Red --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP152741 [WUSCAR] 06133774 (Generated: 04/03/2024 14:54:44) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: NADINE URCIUOLI - VP152741
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 2204406822\Port Coolant [VPA060742] 22 Mar 2024 @ 1500.0 hrs

