
[FRED LOPATIN [LOPATIN]] VOLVO PENTA 7008453402 - PORT DIESEL ENGINE
Sample No: VPA056414
Oil Type: VALVOLINE PREMIUM BLUE 2000 15W40

Jefferson Beach Yacht Sales Inc24400 Jefferson Ave.SAINT CLAIR SHORES, MIUS  48080Contact: DAVID LESHDLESH@JBYS.COMT: F: 

Diagnosis

Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Thecopper level is abnormal. All othercomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VP297371Unique No: 10954144Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 03 Apr 2024
Report Id: VP297371 [WUSCAR] 06134679 (Generated: 04/03/2024 15:01:28) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVID LESH - VP297371

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA056414 VPA042924 --- ---Sample Date 04 Mar 2024 21 Mar 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 618 505 --- ---Oil Hours 110 287 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status ATTENTION ATTENTION --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 100°C cSt 14.8 14.8 --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.2 9.2 --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 68 64 --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % NEG NEG --- ---Soot % % 1.4 1.9 --- ---Nitration (PA) % 78 77 --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 62 65 --- ---Glycol % NEG NEG --- ---Fuel % <1.0 <1.0 --- ---Silicon ppm 23 26 --- ---Sodium ppm 2 2 --- ---Potassium ppm 2 1 --- ---
 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 36 42 --- ---Copper ppm 99 108 --- ---Lead ppm <1 0 --- ---Tin ppm <1 <1 --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 3 --- ---Chromium ppm 3 4 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 53 49 --- ---Nickel ppm 3 3 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 2 2 --- ---Manganese ppm <1 1 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 <1 --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 1422 1418 --- ---Magnesium ppm 828 732 --- ---Zinc ppm 1151 1254 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 867 995 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 15 0 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP297371 [WUSCAR] 06134679 (Generated: 04/03/2024 15:01:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVID LESH - VP297371
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 7008453402\Port Diesel Engine [VPA056414] 04 Mar 2024 @ 618.0 hrs

