
[DENNIS WOODS [7719103]] VOLVO PENTA 3020317240 - STERNDRIVE - PORT GEARBOX
Sample No: VPA055135
Oil Type: VOLVO PENTA GL-5 SAE 75W90

Pacific Power Group - VP9815347215 S 228th StKent, WAUS  98032Contact: PAT RYANpryan@pacificpowergroup.comT: (253)520-5163F: 
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Elemental level of silicon (Si) abovenormal indicating ingress of sealmaterial. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VP99031103Unique No: 10956446Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 05 Apr 2024
Report Id: VP99031103 [WUSCAR] 06136981 (Generated: 04/05/2024 09:26:17) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PAT RYAN - VP99031103

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA055135 --- --- ---Sample Date 26 Mar 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 334 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 96.9 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 23 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 7 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 9 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 22 --- --- ---Iron ppm 74 --- --- ---Copper ppm 1 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 4 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 13 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 28 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 940 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 9 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1534 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 612 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP99031103 [WUSCAR] 06136981 (Generated: 04/05/2024 09:26:19) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PAT RYAN - VP99031103
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 3020317240 - STERNDRIVE\Port Gearbox [VPA055135] 26 Mar 2024 @ 334.0 hrs

