
VOLVO PENTA D6-260 - PORT DIESEL FUEL
Sample No: VPA06140474
Oil Type: No.2 DIESEL FUEL (ULTRALOW SULPHUR)

FDDA FT PIERCE - POWER CENTER
FORT PIERCE, FLUS  Contact: KYLE GRASERk.graser@kirbycorp.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time.All metal levels arenormal indicating no corrosion in thecooling system. The water content isnegligible. There is no indication ofany contamination in the fuel. Thecondition of the fuel is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VP208659Unique No: 10965282Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 05 Apr 2024
Report Id: VP208659 [WUSCAR] 06140474 (Generated: 04/05/2024 18:59:48) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KYLE GRASER - VP208659

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA06140474 --- --- ---Sample Date 04 Apr 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 274 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 FUEL CONDITION

Sulfur ppm 78 --- --- ---Visc @ 40°C cSt 2.46 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % 0.004 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP208659 [WUSCAR] 06140474 (Generated: 04/05/2024 18:59:49) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KYLE GRASER - VP208659
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA D6-260\Port Diesel Fuel [VPA06140474] 04 Apr 2024 @ 274.0 hrs

