
ZF MARINE 255851 - PORT GEARBOX
Sample No: VPA047583
Oil Type: CHEVRON DELO 400 SAE 30

Bay Marine Boatworks Inc.310 West Cutting Blvd.RICHMOND, CAUS  94804Contact: David Vandervoortmax@baymarineboatworks.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.Clutch wear is indicated.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VP601779Unique No: 10982403Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 22 Apr 2024
Report Id: VP601779 [WUSCAR] 06152325 (Generated: 04/23/2024 04:02:25) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: David Vandervoort - VP601779

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA047583 --- --- ---Sample Date 04 Apr 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status ATTENTION --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 95.0 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 9 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 23 --- --- ---Iron ppm 23 --- --- ---Copper ppm 38 --- --- ---Lead ppm 184 --- --- ---Tin ppm 3 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 138 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 2009 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 45 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 794 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 760 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 142 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP601779 [WUSCAR] 06152325 (Generated: 04/23/2024 04:02:27) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: David Vandervoort - VP601779
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	ZF MARINE ZF MARINE 255851\Port Gearbox [VPA047583] 04 Apr 2024 @ .0 hrs

