
[DAVID FROST [44243]] VOLVO PENTA 3200000148 (S/N 320000148) - STARBOARD IPS
Sample No: VPA056000
Oil Type: VOLVO PENTA SAE 15W40

COASTAL CAROLINA YACHT SALES145 LOCKWOOD BLVDCHARLESTON, SCUS  29403Contact: STEVE VASASsteve@ccyachtsales.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Oil and filter change atthe time of sampling has been noted.Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.Gear wear is indicated.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VP568144Unique No: 10982406Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 22 Apr 2024
Report Id: VP568144 [WUSCAR] 06152328 (Generated: 04/23/2024 04:02:50) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEVE VASAS - VP568144

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA056000 --- --- ---Sample Date 29 Mar 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1161 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 105 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 2 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 7 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 35 --- --- ---Iron ppm 238 --- --- ---Copper ppm 29 --- --- ---Lead ppm 2 --- --- ---Tin ppm 1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 2 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 4 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 3 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 8 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 13 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 33 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1608 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 330 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP568144 [WUSCAR] 06152328 (Generated: 04/23/2024 04:02:52) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEVE VASAS - VP568144
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 3200000148 (S/N 320000148)\Starboard IPS [VPA056000] 29 Mar 2024 @ 1161.0 hrs

