
[KURTZ [NBF]] VOLVO PENTA A933991 - PORT DIESEL ENGINE
Sample No: VPA053227
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3

Fordham Marine Services Inc1336 University Blvd NDO NOT USE, FLUS  32211-5226Contact: Nelson Beau Fordham Jrbeaufordham@aol.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
We recommend that you drain the oiland perform a filter service on thiscomponent if not already done. Weadvise that you inspect for thesource(s) of wear. We recommend anearly resample to monitor thiscondition.Piston, ring and cylinderwear is indicated. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The oil is no longerserviceable as a result of theabnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: VP152512Unique No: 10982784Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 23 Apr 2024
Report Id: VP152512 [WUSCAR] 06152706 (Generated: 04/23/2024 09:20:27) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Nelson Beau Fordham Jr - VP152512

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA053227 --- --- ---Sample Date 16 Apr 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 50 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 100°C cSt 13.9 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.5 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 67 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % NEG --- --- ---Soot % % 0.6 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 73 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 60 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 14 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 71 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 7 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 239 --- --- ---Copper ppm 26 --- --- ---Lead ppm 3 --- --- ---Tin ppm 3 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 72 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 18 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 66 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 4 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 2 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 3 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 1168 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 962 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1291 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1179 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 3 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP152512 [WUSCAR] 06152706 (Generated: 04/23/2024 09:20:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Nelson Beau Fordham Jr - VP152512
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA A933991\Port Diesel Engine [VPA053227] 16 Apr 2024 @ .0 hrs

