
[DORRIS] VOLVO PENTA 2204155404 - PORT DIESEL ENGINE
Sample No: VPA059800
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3

Cogswell Marine & Motorsports, Inc865 Stella StreetCHULA VISTA, CAUS  91911Contact: Mitchell CogswellCogswellmarinemotorsports@gmail.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.The iron level is abnormal.The nickel level is abnormal.Elemental level of silicon (Si) abovenormal indicating ingress of sealmaterial. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil.

Depot: VP152133Unique No: 10990462Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 24 Apr 2024
Report Id: VP152133 [WUSCAR] 06155039 (Generated: 04/24/2024 12:29:08) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Mitchell Cogswell - VP152133

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA059800 --- --- ---Sample Date 15 Apr 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 100°C cSt 15.6 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.0 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 86 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % NEG --- --- ---Soot % % 0.4 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 88 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 64 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 149 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 41 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 23 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 95 --- --- ---Copper ppm 26 --- --- ---Lead ppm 4 --- --- ---Tin ppm 3 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 8 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 5 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 34 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 7 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 3337 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 210 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1907 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1558 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 238 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP152133 [WUSCAR] 06155039 (Generated: 04/24/2024 12:29:10) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Mitchell Cogswell - VP152133
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 2204155404\Port Diesel Engine [VPA059800] 15 Apr 2024 @ .0 hrs

