
[PATRICK WELCH [DILLON]] VOLVO PENTA A530499 - STERNDRIVE - STARBOARD GEARBOX
Sample No: VPA053010
Oil Type: VOLVO PENTA GL-5 SAE 75W90

Endor Marine LLC - Coastal Marine - 1521244300 11th Ave. NWSEATTLE, WAUS  98107Contact: WILLOW YANARELLAservice@coastalmarineengine.comT: (206)784-3703F: (206)784-8823
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. The oil changeat the time of sampling has beennoted. We advise that you inspect forthe source(s) of wear. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.The iron levelis severe. Appearance is milky. Thereis a high concentration of waterpresent in the oil. The high sodium(Na) level indicates the possiblepresence of salt water. The oil is nolonger serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: VP794951Unique No: 10991725Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 24 Apr 2024
Report Id: VP794951 [WUSCAR] 06156302 (Generated: 04/25/2024 18:25:35) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: WILLOW YANARELLA - VP794951

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA053010 VPA055426 --- ---Sample Date 17 Apr 2024 28 Mar 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 370 329 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed N/A --- ---Sample Status SEVERE ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 108 104 --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % 1.71 NEG --- ---Silicon ppm 12 20 --- ---Sodium ppm 110 17 --- ---Potassium ppm 3 <1 --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 49 29 --- ---Iron ppm 311 156 --- ---Copper ppm 3 0 --- ---Lead ppm 0 0 --- ---Tin ppm <1 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 2 --- ---Chromium ppm 4 2 --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 0 --- ---Nickel ppm 7 7 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 5 3 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 40 8 --- ---Magnesium ppm 27 4 --- ---Zinc ppm 49 16 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1407 1479 --- ---Barium ppm 1 0 --- ---Boron ppm 314 334 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP794951 [WUSCAR] 06156302 (Generated: 04/25/2024 18:25:37) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: WILLOW YANARELLA - VP794951
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA A530499 - STERNDRIVE\Starboard Gearbox [VPA053010] 17 Apr 2024 @ 370.0 hrs

