
[PATRICK WELCH [DILLON]] VOLVO PENTA A522651 - STERNDRIVE - PORT GEARBOX
Sample No: VPA053009
Oil Type: VOLVO PENTA GL-5 SAE 75W90

Endor Marine LLC - Coastal Marine - 1521244300 11th Ave. NWSEATTLE, WAUS  98107Contact: WILLOW YANARELLAservice@coastalmarineengine.comT: (206)784-3703F: (206)784-8823
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. The oil changeat the time of sampling has beennoted. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.The iron level is abnormal.Appearance is milky. There is a highconcentration of water present in theoil. The high sodium (Na) levelindicates the possible presence ofsalt water. The oil is no longerserviceable due to the presence ofcontaminants.

Depot: VP794951Unique No: 10991726Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 24 Apr 2024
Report Id: VP794951 [WUSCAR] 06156303 (Generated: 04/25/2024 18:25:26) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: WILLOW YANARELLA - VP794951

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA053009 VPA055423 --- ---Sample Date 17 Apr 2024 28 Mar 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 373 329 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed N/A --- ---Sample Status SEVERE SEVERE --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 108 110 --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % 1.54 1.47 --- ---Silicon ppm 10 27 --- ---Sodium ppm 119 175 --- ---Potassium ppm 5 8 --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 34 15 --- ---Iron ppm 267 394 --- ---Copper ppm 3 <1 --- ---Lead ppm 0 0 --- ---Tin ppm <1 <1 --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 5 --- ---Chromium ppm 3 4 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 0 --- ---Nickel ppm 4 5 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 <1 --- ---Manganese ppm 4 4 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 19 13 --- ---Magnesium ppm 19 29 --- ---Zinc ppm 26 0 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1361 1491 --- ---Barium ppm 1 0 --- ---Boron ppm 302 311 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP794951 [WUSCAR] 06156303 (Generated: 04/25/2024 18:25:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: WILLOW YANARELLA - VP794951
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA A522651 - STERNDRIVE\Port Gearbox [VPA053009] 17 Apr 2024 @ 373.0 hrs

