
[BRAD LARKIN [1610087]] VOLVO PENTA 3194001727 - STARBOARD IPS
Sample No: VPA048335
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 75W90

Pacific Power Group - VP9815347215 S 228th StKent, WAUS  98032Contact: PAT RYANpryan@pacificpowergroup.comT: (253)520-5163F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VP99031103Unique No: 11002867Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 30 Apr 2024
Report Id: VP99031103 [WUSCAR] 06162148 (Generated: 05/04/2024 01:07:38) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PAT RYAN - VP99031103

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA048335 VPA046252 VPA034487 ---Sample Date 18 Apr 2024 03 Apr 2023 11 Jan 2021 ---Machine Hours 1652 1489 800 ---Oil Hours 163 0 0 ---Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ---Sample Status NORMAL ATTENTION NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 94.7 106 104 ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % NEG NEG NEG ---Silicon ppm 4 10 18 ---Sodium ppm 2 2 11 ---Potassium ppm 0 2 1 ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 19 17 28 ---Iron ppm 29 84 80 ---Copper ppm 2 5 8 ---Lead ppm 0 0 5 ---Tin ppm 0 0 0 ---Aluminum ppm 0 0 6 ---Chromium ppm 0 1 <1 ---Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 0 ---Nickel ppm 0 <1 1 ---Titanium ppm 0 0 0 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm <1 2 1 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 2 11 9 ---Magnesium ppm 0 18 2 ---Zinc ppm 0 8 26 ---Phosphorus ppm 1326 1305 1298 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 535 316 270 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP99031103 [WUSCAR] 06162148 (Generated: 05/04/2024 01:07:40) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PAT RYAN - VP99031103
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 3194001727\Starboard IPS [VPA048335] 18 Apr 2024 @ 1652.0 hrs

