
[JIM MILGARD [EVAN/502887]] VOLVO PENTA 3194009630 - PORT IPS
Sample No: VPA059286
Oil Type: VOLVO PENTA GL-5 SAE 75W90

Endor Marine LLC - Coastal Marine - 1521244300 11th Ave. NWSEATTLE, WAUS  98107Contact: WILLOW YANARELLAservice@coastalmarineengine.comT: (206)784-3703F: (206)784-8823
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. Werecommend that you drain the oilfrom the component if this has notalready been done. We recommendan early resample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. Appearance is milky.There is a high concentration ofwater present in the oil. The oil is nolonger serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: VP794951Unique No: 11016350Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 08 May 2024
Report Id: VP794951 [WUSCAR] 06170297 (Generated: 05/10/2024 23:31:57) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: WILLOW YANARELLA - VP794951

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA059286 VPA014068 --- ---Sample Date 30 Apr 2024 26 Oct 2017 --- ---Machine Hours 576 363 --- ---Oil Hours 576 0 --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd --- ---Sample Status SEVERE ATTENTION --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 108 99.7 --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % 1.49 NEG --- ---Silicon ppm 11 27 --- ---Sodium ppm 99 2 --- ---Potassium ppm 6 11 --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 28 27 --- ---Iron ppm 109 66 --- ---Copper ppm 8 6 --- ---Lead ppm 2 <1 --- ---Tin ppm 3 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 2 --- ---Chromium ppm 2 <1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 1 <1 --- ---Nickel ppm 2 <1 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 0 --- ---Silver ppm <1 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 5 2 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 35 7 --- ---Magnesium ppm 13 5 --- ---Zinc ppm 36 16 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1511 1294 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 267 264 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP794951 [WUSCAR] 06170297 (Generated: 05/10/2024 23:31:59) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: WILLOW YANARELLA - VP794951
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 3194009630\Port IPS [VPA059286] 30 Apr 2024 @ 576.0 hrs

