
[WELSBERG [C17103]] VOLVO PENTA 5102074110J - MAIN ENGINE
Sample No: VPA061845
Oil Type: SHELL ROTELLA T 15W40

Walstrom Marine - 767948501 Bay StreetHARBOR SPRINGS, MIUS  49740Contact: RICK HEINYrheiny@walstrom.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. Tests do not reveal causefor reported problem.All componentwear rates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VP154879Unique No: 11021125Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 13 May 2024
Report Id: VP154879 [WUSCAR] 06175072 (Generated: 05/13/2024 14:58:23) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RICK HEINY - VP154879

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA061845 --- --- ---Sample Date 07 May 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1 --- --- ---Oil Hours 1 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 100°C cSt 14.0 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.6 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 63 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % NEG --- --- ---Soot % % 0.1 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 46 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 52 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 7 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 3 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 22 --- --- ---Copper ppm 3 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 7 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 32 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 1902 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 374 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1266 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1057 --- --- ---Barium ppm 2 --- --- ---Boron ppm 110 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP154879 [WUSCAR] 06175072 (Generated: 05/13/2024 14:58:25) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RICK HEINY - VP154879
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 5102074110J\Main Engine [VPA061845] 07 May 2024 @ .8 hrs

