
[WELSBERG [C10703]] VOLVO PENTA 5102074110J - MAIN COOLANT
Sample No: VPA061846
Oil Type: VOLVO COOLANT VCS (YELLOW)

Walstrom Marine - 767948501 Bay StreetHARBOR SPRINGS, MIUS  49740Contact: RICK HEINYrheiny@walstrom.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
We recommend drain/flush system,and refill with 50/50 antifreeze watermixture. Sediment present.Carboxylate test failed. The glycollevel is acceptable. The pH level ofthis fluid is within the acceptablelimits.

Depot: VP154879Unique No: 11022065Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 16 May 2024
Report Id: VP154879 [WUSCAR] 06176012 (Generated: 05/16/2024 16:58:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RICK HEINY - VP154879

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA061846 --- --- ---Sample Date 07 May 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1 --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITION

pH Scale 0-14 8.16 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm NT --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 35.1 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C -3 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Coolant Appearance sediment --- --- ---Coolant Color Yllow --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP154879 [WUSCAR] 06176012 (Generated: 05/16/2024 16:58:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RICK HEINY - VP154879
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 5102074110J\Main Coolant [VPA061846] 07 May 2024 @ .8 hrs

