
[KATIE] NORTHERN LIGHTS 0642-56786 - PORT GENSET
Sample No: VPA051768
Oil Type: VOLVO VDS-4.5 Premium Motor Oil 15W40

NEWT MARINE5 JONES STDUBUQUE, IAUS  52001Contact: DON LEIKservice@newtmarine.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VP99298099Unique No: 11022892Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 14 May 2024
Report Id: VP99298099 [WUSCAR] 06176839 (Generated: 05/14/2024 17:54:57) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DON LEIK - VP99298099

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA051768 VPA038882 VPA038796 VPA038823Sample Date 25 Mar 2024 03 Oct 2022 05 Jul 2022 14 Apr 2022Machine Hours 2838 1806 1241 1057Oil Hours 0 534 0 1057Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL ATTENTION ATTENTION
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 100°C cSt 13.1 12.6 10.6 10.5Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.1 10.6 9.1 10.2Oxidation (PA) % 71 64 77 76
 CONTAMINATION

Water % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.2 0.1 0.2 0.2Nitration (PA) % 59 54 78 81Sulfation (PA) % 60 59 63 64Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 0.2Silicon ppm 13 5 16 16Sodium ppm 3 2 4 4Potassium ppm 2 1 <1 <1
 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 34 18 47 41Copper ppm 17 13 203 180Lead ppm 4 1 4 3Tin ppm 1 <1 2 1Aluminum ppm 2 1 4 4Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 75 67 214 223Nickel ppm <1 <1 0 0Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 <1 <1Manganese ppm 1 <1 4 4Vanadium ppm <1 0 <1 0
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 1182 1150 1480 1530Magnesium ppm 1020 993 827 851Zinc ppm 1340 1308 1055 1005Phosphorus ppm 1155 1077 863 925Barium ppm 2 0 2 0Boron ppm 4 9 193 214

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP99298099 [WUSCAR] 06176839 (Generated: 05/14/2024 17:54:59) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DON LEIK - VP99298099
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	NORTHERN LIGHTS NORTHERN LIGHTS 0642-56786\Port Genset [VPA051768] 25 Mar 2024 @ 2838.0 hrs

