
[KEN THOMAS [GREG ELLIS]] VOLVO PENTA 3940023777 - STARBOARD IPS
Sample No: VPA059894
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 75W90

Galati Yacht Sales LLC900 S. BAY BLVD., PO Box 862ANNA MARIA, FLUS  34216Contact: RICK HERNYrherny@galatiyachts.comT: (727)576-8336F: 
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.The iron levelis abnormal. All other componentwear rates are normal. There is a lightconcentration of water present in theoil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VP648685Unique No: 11034504Signed: Angela BorellaReport Date: 21 May 2024
Report Id: VP648685 [WUSCAR] 06183178 (Generated: 05/21/2024 17:06:11) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: xx60068 - RICK HERNY - VP648685

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA059894 --- --- ---Sample Date 13 May 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 430 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 108 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % 0.774 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 18 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 29 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 17 --- --- ---Iron ppm 343 --- --- ---Copper ppm 33 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 8 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 6 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 0 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 0 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 7 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1480 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 303 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP648685 [WUSCAR] 06183178 (Generated: 05/21/2024 17:06:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: xx60068 - RICK HERNY - VP648685
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 3940023777\Starboard IPS [VPA059894] 13 May 2024 @ 430.0 hrs

