
[JOSEPH DUCEY] VOLVO PENTA A1098717 - STARBOARD COOLANT
Sample No: VPA013888
Oil Type: VOLVO COOLANT VCS (YELLOW)

WESTERN BRANCH DIESEL400 SENSATION WEIGHBEAUFORT, NCUS  28516Contact: CHRISTINA MERRELLcmerrell@wbdiesel.comT: (252)504-2185F: (252)504-3062
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. The fluid is suitable forfurther service. There is no indicationof any contamination in the coolant.Carboxylate test failed. The glycollevel is acceptable. The pH level ofthis fluid is within the acceptablelimits.

Depot: VP141534Unique No: 11043378Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 29 May 2024
Report Id: VP141534 [WUSCAR] 06186626 (Generated: 05/29/2024 15:23:17) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHRISTINA MERRELL - VP141534

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA013888 --- --- ---Sample Date 18 May 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 370 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITION

pH Scale 0-14 7.84 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm NT --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 50.1 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C -35 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Coolant Appearance normal --- --- ---Coolant Color Red --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP141534 [WUSCAR] 06186626 (Generated: 05/29/2024 15:23:18) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHRISTINA MERRELL - VP141534
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA A1098717\Starboard Coolant [VPA013888] 18 May 2024 @ 370.0 hrs

