
[[MEYER]] 1013720602 - PORT COOLANT
Sample No: VPA036322
Oil Type: VOLVO COOLANT VCS (YELLOW)

VIRGINIA PILOT ASSOCIATION3329 SHORE DRVIRGINIA BEACH, VAUS  23451Contact: RYAN BRYANTbryant_j@vapilotassn.comT: (757)692-3439F: 
Diagnosis
We recommend drain/flush system,and refill with 50/50 antifreeze watermixture. Appearance is unacceptable.Carboxylate test failed. The pH levelof this fluid is within the acceptablelimits. The glycol level is acceptable.The coolant is no longer serviceabledue to the presence of contaminants.

Depot: VPVIRVIRUnique No: 11046895Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 03 Jun 2024
Report Id: VPVIRVIR [WUSCAR] 06190143 (Generated: 06/04/2024 04:11:04) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: RYAN BRYANT - VPVIRVIR

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA036322 --- --- ---Sample Date 21 May 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITION

pH Scale 0-14 6.98 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm 0 --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 43.0 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C -19 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Coolant Appearance abnormal --- --- ---Coolant Color Yllow --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VPVIRVIR [WUSCAR] 06190143 (Generated: 06/04/2024 04:11:06) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: RYAN BRYANT - VPVIRVIR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA 1013720602\Port Coolant [VPA036322] 21 May 2024 @ .0 hrs

