
[LIANE RUSSELL [1]] VOLVO PENTA A1110856 - PORT COOLANT
Sample No: VPA042171
Oil Type: VOLVO COOLANT VCS (YELLOW)

SINGLETON YACHT CENTER6930 LANIER ISLANDS PKWYBUFORD, GAUS  30002Contact: DJ HARDEEdj@singletonmarinegroup.comT: (770)614-3007F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of oil. Recommend draincoolant if not already done and flushbefore refilling with coolant. There isa high concentration of oil present inthe coolant. The glycol level is lowerthan acceptable. The pH level of thisfluid is within the acceptable limits.The coolant is no longer serviceabledue to the presence of contaminants.

Depot: VP159751Unique No: 11049480Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 30 May 2024
Report Id: VP159751 [WUSCAR] 06192728 (Generated: 05/30/2024 21:29:33) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: DJ HARDEE - VP159751

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA042171 --- --- ---Sample Date 23 May 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 164 --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITION

pH Scale 0-14 7.56 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm 0 --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 35.4 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C -3 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Coolant Appearance oil --- --- ---Coolant Color Yllow --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP159751 [WUSCAR] 06192728 (Generated: 05/30/2024 21:29:35) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: DJ HARDEE - VP159751
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA A1110856\Port Coolant [VPA042171] 23 May 2024 @ 164.0 hrs

