
[NADINE URCIUOLI [JUSTIN SILVERS]] VOLVO PENTA 3940019915 - PORT IPS
Sample No: VPA054851
Oil Type: VOLVO API GL-5 SAE 75W90

Helmuts Marine Service619 Canal StreetSAN RAFAEL, CAUS  94901-3545Contact: NADINE URCIUOLISERVICE@HELMUTSMARINE.COMT:  x:F:  x:
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.The ironlevel is abnormal. All othercomponent wear rates are normal.The water content is negligible. Thereis no indication of any contaminationin the oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VP152741Unique No: 11058174Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 03 Jun 2024
Report Id: VP152741 [WUSCAR] 06196051 (Generated: 06/03/2024 18:04:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: NADINE URCIUOLI - VP152741

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA054851 --- --- ---Sample Date 24 May 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 357 --- --- ---Oil Hours 357 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 106 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % 0.374 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 15 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 21 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 26 --- --- ---Iron ppm 255 --- --- ---Copper ppm 21 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 6 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 8 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 54 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 54 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1308 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 259 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP152741 [WUSCAR] 06196051 (Generated: 06/03/2024 18:04:13) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: NADINE URCIUOLI - VP152741
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 3940019915\Port IPS [VPA054851] 24 May 2024 @ 357.0 hrs

