
[JOURNEY [JOURNEY]] KOHLER 33F4GMLC0005 - STARBOARD GENSET
Sample No: VPA057204
Oil Type: SHELL ROTELLA T6 5W40

WINDSERVE MARINE10 MACNAUGHT STNORTH KINGSTOWN, RIUS  02852Contact: Ryan LinnRyanL@windservemarine.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. Oil and filterchange at the time of sampling hasbeen noted. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. There is a moderateconcentration of water present in theoil. The BN result indicates that thereis suitable alkalinity remaining in theoil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VPSENNORUnique No: 11059512Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 11 Jun 2024
Report Id: VPSENNOR [WUSCAR] 06197389 (Generated: 06/11/2024 09:24:36) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Ryan Linn - VPSENNOR

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA057204 --- --- ---Sample Date 18 May 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 909 --- --- ---Oil Hours 909 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 100°C cSt 14.42 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.4 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 67 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % 0.532 --- --- ---Soot % % 0.1 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 78 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 53 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % 0.8 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 9 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 4 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 6 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 12 --- --- ---Copper ppm 5 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 1993 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 142 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1185 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1015 --- --- ---Barium ppm 2 --- --- ---Boron ppm 161 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VPSENNOR [WUSCAR] 06197389 (Generated: 06/11/2024 09:24:38) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Ryan Linn - VPSENNOR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	KOHLER KOHLER 33F4GMLC0005\Starboard Genset [VPA057204] 18 May 2024 @ 909.0 hrs

