
[ERIC K] VOLVO PENTA ERIC K (S/N NOT GIVEN) - PORT IPS
Sample No: VPA053622
Oil Type: {unknown}

Harry`s Marine Service LLC1141 N. Citrus St.Orange, CAUS  92887Contact: TARAH AULDinfo@harrysmarine.comT: (714)771-7899F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.The aluminum level isabnormal. All other component wearrates are normal. There is a trace ofmoisture present in the oil. No othercontaminants were detected in theoil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VP867279Unique No: 11069423Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 06 Jun 2024
Report Id: VP867279 [WUSCAR] 06201962 (Generated: 06/11/2024 11:53:01) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TARAH AULD - VP867279

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA053622 --- --- ---Sample Date 05 Jun 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 110.3 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % 0.291 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 13 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 0 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 21 --- --- ---Iron ppm 38 --- --- ---Copper ppm 8 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 139 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 11 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 4 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 23 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1216 --- --- ---Barium ppm 1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 267 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP867279 [WUSCAR] 06201962 (Generated: 06/11/2024 11:53:03) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TARAH AULD - VP867279
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA ERIC K (S/N NOT GIVEN)\Port IPS [VPA053622] 05 Jun 2024 @ .0 hrs

