
[[MARTINELLI]] VOLVO PENTA 2006005345 - STARBOARD COOLANT
Sample No: VPA054232
Oil Type: VOLVO COOLANT (GREEN)

SUNCOAST DIESEL MARINE6341 PORTER ROAD, SUITE 6SARASOTA, FLUS  34240Contact: JOSHUAjoshua@suncoastdmi.comT: (941)342-0033F: (941)342-0088
Diagnosis
We recommend drain/flush system,and refill with 50/50 antifreeze watermixture. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.Metal levels are highindicating corrosion in the coolingsystem. Appearance is unacceptable.There is a high amount of visiblesediment present in the sample.Glycol and nitrite levels areacceptable. The pH level of this fluidis within the acceptable limits.

Depot: VP705283Unique No: 11069429Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 07 Jun 2024
Report Id: VP705283 [WUSCAR] 06201968 (Generated: 06/07/2024 09:23:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOSHUA ? - VP705283

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA054232 --- --- ---Sample Date 31 May 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 9714 --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITION

Boron ppm 194 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 12 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 1455 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 39 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 99 --- --- ---pH Scale 0-14 7.62 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 14 --- --- ---Nitrites ppm 1012 --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 41.0 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C -15 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Magnesium ppm 7 --- --- ---Calcium ppm 6 --- --- ---Coolant Appearance abnormal --- --- ---Coolant Color Black --- --- ---
 CORROSION

Iron ppm 53 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 5 --- --- ---Copper ppm 19 --- --- ---Lead ppm 22 --- --- ---Tin ppm 1 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP705283 [WUSCAR] 06201968 (Generated: 06/07/2024 09:23:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOSHUA ? - VP705283
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 2006005345\Starboard Coolant [VPA054232] 31 May 2024 @ 9714.0 hrs

