
[FRAMPTON] VOLVO PENTA 3200002284 - PORT IPS
Sample No: VPA057433
Oil Type: VOLVO API GL-5 SAE 75W90

Outstanding MarinePO Box 274GALENA, MDUS  21635Contact: Ronda Bolingerrlwb@verizon.netT: F: 
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.The tin level isabnormal. All other component wearrates are normal. Appearance ismilky.  There is a high concentrationof water present in the oil. The oilviscosity is higher than normal. Theoil is no longer serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: VP153685Unique No: 11071099Signed: Angela BorellaReport Date: 12 Jun 2024
Report Id: VP153685 [WUSCAR] 06203638 (Generated: 06/12/2024 11:50:01) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Ronda Bolinger - VP153685

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA057433 --- --- ---Sample Date 05 Jun 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 498 --- --- ---Oil Hours 300 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 118 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % 7.23 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 2 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 54 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 3 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 30 --- --- ---Iron ppm 113 --- --- ---Copper ppm 14 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 4 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 44 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 33 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 32 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1628 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 241 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP153685 [WUSCAR] 06203638 (Generated: 06/12/2024 11:50:02) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Ronda Bolinger - VP153685
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 3200002284\Port IPS [VPA057433] 05 Jun 2024 @ 498.0 hrs

