
[JAMES WARD [SR00100154]] VOLVO PENTA A113295 - PORT DIESEL ENGINE
Sample No: VPA061448
Oil Type: {unknown}

Pacific Power Group - VP9815347215 S 228th StKent, WAUS  98032Contact: STEVE CAREYscarey@pacificpowergroup.comT: (253)740-0842F:  x:
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor. Pleasenote that this is a corrected copy fordata entry updates.All componentwear rates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VP99031103Unique No: 11072474Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 18 Jun 2024
Report Id: VP99031103 [WUSCAR] 06205013 (Generated: 06/18/2024 17:02:10) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: STEVE CAREY - VP99031103

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA061448 --- --- ---Sample Date 05 Jun 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 106 --- --- ---Visc @ 100°C cSt 14.1 --- --- ---Viscosity Index (VI) Scale 134 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 51 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % NEG --- --- ---Soot % % 0.1 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 53 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 50 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 6 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 8 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 3 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 13 --- --- ---Copper ppm 6 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 4 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 1267 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 655 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 790 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 689 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 115 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP99031103 [WUSCAR] 06205013 (Generated: 06/18/2024 17:02:12) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: STEVE CAREY - VP99031103
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA A113295\Port Diesel Engine [VPA061448] 05 Jun 2024 @ .0 hrs

