
[DAVID BELL] VOLVO PENTA 7009117712 - STARBOARD COOLANT
Sample No: VPA058637
Oil Type: EXTENDED LIFE COOLANT

MARINE EVOLUTIONS6831 HILL PARK DRLORTON, VAUS  22079Contact: TIM STAPLEStim@marineevolutions.comT: (703)345-0365F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. The fluid is suitable forfurther service. There is no indicationof any contamination in the coolant.Carboxylate test failed. The glycollevel is acceptable. The pH level ofthis fluid is within the acceptablelimits.

Depot: VP446360Unique No: 11075707Signed: Angela BorellaReport Date: 14 Jun 2024
Report Id: VP446360 [WUSCAR] 06208246 (Generated: 06/14/2024 14:28:18) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TIM STAPLES - VP446360

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA058637 --- --- ---Sample Date 07 Jun 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1945 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITION

pH Scale 0-14 7.82 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm NT --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 43.2 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C -19 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Coolant Appearance normal --- --- ---Coolant Color Orange --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP446360 [WUSCAR] 06208246 (Generated: 06/14/2024 14:28:19) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TIM STAPLES - VP446360
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 7009117712\Starboard Coolant [VPA058637] 07 Jun 2024 @ 1945.0 hrs

