
[MARK & SUE RINGHAM [MSR]] VOLVO PENTA 7008496978 - STARBOARD DIESEL ENGINE
Sample No: VPA059421
Oil Type: VOLVO VDS-4.5 Premium Motor Oil 15W40

ALL SYSTEMS MARINE700 MYRICK STPENSACOLA, FLUS  32505Contact: TRISTAN JOHNSONallsystemsmarine@yahoo.comT: (228)218-7963F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: VP99220003Unique No: 11097248Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 26 Jun 2024
Report Id: VP99220003 [WUSCAR] 06219051 (Generated: 06/27/2024 12:19:36) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TRISTAN JOHNSON - VP99220003

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA059421 VPA059972 VPA055379 VPA041135Sample Date 19 Jun 2024 24 Apr 2024 21 Oct 2023 20 May 2023Machine Hours 1048 849 654 451Oil Hours 199 195 203 201Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 100°C cSt 13.1 13.1 13.1 13.0Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 10.0 9.6 9.9 10.2Oxidation (PA) % 59 57 57 60
 CONTAMINATION

Water % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.4 0.1 0.1 0.1Nitration (PA) % 53 46 46 50Sulfation (PA) % 54 53 52 55Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 11 10 65 10Sodium ppm 2 <1 <1 2Potassium ppm 3 0 2 1
 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 9 3 <1 3Copper ppm 46 8 2 5Lead ppm 2 0 <1 0Tin ppm <1 0 0 0Aluminum ppm 2 <1 1 <1Chromium ppm <1 0 0 0Molybdenum ppm 59 64 56 62Nickel ppm <1 0 <1 0Titanium ppm <1 0 0 0Silver ppm <1 0 <1 0Manganese ppm <1 2 <1 0Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 1272 1119 963 1155Magnesium ppm 974 977 895 977Zinc ppm 1353 1261 1207 1314Phosphorus ppm 1106 1094 1015 1060Barium ppm 0 <1 0 0Boron ppm 9 6 4 <1

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP99220003 [WUSCAR] 06219051 (Generated: 06/27/2024 12:19:38) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TRISTAN JOHNSON - VP99220003
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 7008496978\Starboard Diesel Engine [VPA059421] 19 Jun 2024 @ 1048.0 hrs

