
[KEMICHIRI] VOLVO PENTA 3200000007 - PORT IPS
Sample No: VPA062935
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 75W90

Marine International Diesels Inc.3600 HACIENDA BLVD UNIT GDAVIE, FLUS  33314Contact: ASHANTI BURKEaburke@midiflorida.comT: (954)761-1086F: (954)761-1186
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. The oil changeat the time of sampling has beennoted. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. Appearance is milky.There is a high concentration ofwater present in the oil. The highsodium (Na) level indicates thepossible presence of salt water. Theoil is no longer serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: VP694356Unique No: 11099756Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 28 Jun 2024
Report Id: VP694356 [WUSCAR] 06221559 (Generated: 06/29/2024 03:54:53) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ASHANTI BURKE - VP694356

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA062935 --- --- ---Sample Date 03 Jun 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 293 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 108 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % 0.927 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 3 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 71 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 5 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 23 --- --- ---Iron ppm 178 --- --- ---Copper ppm 18 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 4 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 4 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 69 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 30 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 87 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1323 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 224 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP694356 [WUSCAR] 06221559 (Generated: 06/29/2024 03:54:56) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ASHANTI BURKE - VP694356
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 3200000007\Port IPS [VPA062935] 03 Jun 2024 @ 293.0 hrs

