
[PHANTOM OF ART] VOLVO PENTA 3950008059 (S/N 3950008060) - STARBOARD IPS
Sample No: VPA062931
Oil Type: VOLVO PENTA GL-5 SAE 75W90

Marine International Diesels Inc.3600 HACIENDA BLVD UNIT GDAVIE, FLUS  33314Contact: ASHANTI BURKEaburke@midiflorida.comT: (954)761-1086F: (954)761-1186
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. Werecommend that you drain the oilfrom the component if this has notalready been done. We recommendan early resample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. Appearance isunacceptable. There is a highconcentration of water present in theoil. Moderate concentration of visibledirt/debris present in the oil. Thehigh sodium (Na) level indicates thepossible presence of salt water. Theoil is no longer serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: VP694356Unique No: 11099757Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 27 Jun 2024
Report Id: VP694356 [WUSCAR] 06221560 (Generated: 07/02/2024 01:04:37) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ASHANTI BURKE - VP694356

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA062931 --- --- ---Sample Date 25 Jun 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 237 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 110 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % 1.82 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 5 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 205 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 10 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 22 --- --- ---Iron ppm 62 --- --- ---Copper ppm 11 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 3 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 23 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 46 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 103 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1408 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 204 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP694356 [WUSCAR] 06221560 (Generated: 07/02/2024 01:04:46) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ASHANTI BURKE - VP694356
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 3950008059 (S/N 3950008060)\Starboard IPS [VPA062931] 25 Jun 2024 @ 237.0 hrs

