
ZF 20235427 - ZEUS DRIVE - STARBOARD TRANSMISSION
Sample No: VPA052728
Oil Type: {unknown}

ALL SYSTEMS MARINE3910 WEST NAVY BLVDPENSACOLA, FLUS  32507Contact: TRISTAN JOHNSONallsystemsmarine@yahoo.comT: (228)218-7963F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you inspect for thesource(s) of wear. We recommend anearly resample to monitor thiscondition.Moderate concentration ofvisible metal present. Clutch wear isindicated. Clutch disc wear or oilcooler leaching indicated. There is noindication of any contamination inthe fluid. The condition of the fluid isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VP99220003Unique No: 11103028Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 03 Jul 2024
Report Id: VP99220003 [WUSCAR] 06224831 (Generated: 07/03/2024 11:46:00) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TRISTAN JOHNSON - VP99220003

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA052728 --- --- ---Sample Date 27 Jun 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 86.8 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 3 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 0 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 4 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 23 --- --- ---Iron ppm 36 --- --- ---Copper ppm 407 --- --- ---Lead ppm 82 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 39 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 1110 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 5 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 370 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 485 --- --- ---Barium ppm 2 --- --- ---Boron ppm 100 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP99220003 [WUSCAR] 06224831 (Generated: 07/03/2024 11:46:02) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TRISTAN JOHNSON - VP99220003
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	ZF ZF 20235427 - ZEUS DRIVE\Starboard Transmission [VPA052728] 27 Jun 2024 @ .0 hrs

