
[GENE DORN [GREG E.]] VOLVO PENTA 3200003534 - PORT IPS
Sample No: VPA057439
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 75W90

Galati Yacht Sales LLC900 S. BAY BLVD., PO Box 862ANNA MARIA, FLUS  34216Contact: SEAN CARDOWSCARDOW@GALATIYACHTS.COMT: F: 
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Gear wearis indicated. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VP648685Unique No: 11111361Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 07 Jul 2024
Report Id: VP648685 [WUSCAR] 06227868 (Generated: 07/08/2024 07:20:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SEAN CARDOW - VP648685

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA057439 VPA056273 --- ---Sample Date 26 Jun 2024 30 Jun 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 168 40 --- ---Oil Hours 127 40 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status ATTENTION NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 103 104 --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % NEG NEG --- ---Silicon ppm 4 4 --- ---Sodium ppm 11 4 --- ---Potassium ppm 4 7 --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 18 16 --- ---Iron ppm 300 24 --- ---Copper ppm 16 7 --- ---Lead ppm 0 0 --- ---Tin ppm 0 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm 13 <1 --- ---Chromium ppm 2 0 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 0 --- ---Nickel ppm 3 0 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 8 4 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 8 23 --- ---Magnesium ppm 6 874 --- ---Zinc ppm 195 <1 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1452 1588 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 263 697 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP648685 [WUSCAR] 06227868 (Generated: 07/08/2024 07:20:33) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SEAN CARDOW - VP648685
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 3200003534\Port IPS [VPA057439] 26 Jun 2024 @ 168.0 hrs

