
[ALASKA LUXURY TOURS [FARGO]] VOLVO PENTA 3200005799 - PORT IPS
Sample No: VPA036718
Oil Type: VOLVO PENTA GL-5 SAE 75W90

Sundance Mfg Inc570 N.E. Tomahawk Isl. Dr.Portland, ORUS  97217Contact: CLARK HOLMESclark@sundanceyachts.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Oil and filter change atthe time of sampling has been noted.Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. The water content isnegligible. No other contaminantswere detected in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VP154394Unique No: 11114407Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 10 Jul 2024
Report Id: VP154394 [WUSCAR] 06230914 (Generated: 07/10/2024 13:06:02) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CLARK HOLMES - VP154394

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA036718 --- --- ---Sample Date 02 Jul 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 445 --- --- ---Oil Hours 445 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 85.9 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % 0.144 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 5 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 7 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 12 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 26 --- --- ---Iron ppm 75 --- --- ---Copper ppm 24 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 4 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 69 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 870 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 43 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1523 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 556 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP154394 [WUSCAR] 06230914 (Generated: 07/10/2024 13:06:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CLARK HOLMES - VP154394
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 3200005799\Port IPS [VPA036718] 02 Jul 2024 @ 445.0 hrs

