
[JASON HAMPTON [40449]] VOLVO PENTA 2071172136 - COOLANT
Sample No: VPA051075
Oil Type: CONVENTIONAL COOLANT

TRUE NORTH MARINE1206 MARINA BAY DRCLEAR LAKE SHORES, TXUS  77565Contact: Eric Basdekise.basdekis@truenorth-marine.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
The fluid is suitable for furtherservice. There is no indication of anycontamination in the coolant. Glycoland nitrite levels are acceptable. ThepH level of this fluid is within theacceptable limits.

Depot: VP975860Unique No: 11116233Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 15 Jul 2024
Report Id: VP975860 [WUSCAR] 06232740 (Generated: 07/15/2024 09:39:09) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Eric Basdekis - VP975860

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA051075 --- --- ---Sample Date 02 Jul 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITION

pH Scale 0-14 10.0 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm 900 --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 46.8 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C -26 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Coolant Appearance normal --- --- ---Coolant Color Green --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP975860 [WUSCAR] 06232740 (Generated: 07/15/2024 09:39:11) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Eric Basdekis - VP975860
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 2071172136\Coolant [VPA051075] 02 Jul 2024 @ .0 hrs

