
Sample Rating Trend

NORMALOIL ANALYSIS REPORT

Machine Id

RBK-G1-UGBR/THBR
Component

Bearing
Fluid

 DIAGNOSIS

Recommendation

Resample at the next service interval to monitor.

Wear

All component wear rates are normal.

Contamination

There is no indication of any contamination in the

component.

Fluid Condition

The condition of oil is suitable for further service.

Report Id: NEWSTJ [WCAMIS] 00954099 (Generated: 11/17/2023 07:39:28) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Shane Reid - NEWSTJ

 SAMPLE INFORMATION method limit/base current history1 history2

Sample Number Client Info WC549952 WC549899 WC549951

Sample Date Client Info 07 Jun 2002 29 May 2002 24 May 2002

Machine Age mths Client Info 0 0 0

Oil Age mths Client Info 18 17 17

Oil Changed Client Info N/A N/A N/A

Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL

 SAMPLE IMAGES method limit/base current history1 history2

Color no image no image no image

Bottom no image no image no image

Page 1 of 2



OIL ANALYSIS REPORT

Laboratory : WearCheck - C8-1175 Appleby Line, Burlington, ON L7L 5H9

Sample No. : WC549952

Lab Number : 00954099

Unique Number : 1259693

Test Package : IND 2

Received : 12 Jun 2002

Diagnosed : 13 Jun 2002

Diagnostician : 

To discuss this sample report, contact Customer Service at 1-800-268-2131.

Test denoted (*) outside scope of accreditation, (m) method modified, (e) tested at external lab.

Validity of results and interpretation are based on the sample and information as supplied.

NEWFOUNDLAND POWER INC.

50 DUFFY PLACE, PO BOX 8910

ST. JOHNS, NL

CA  A1B 3P6

Contact: Shane Reid

sreid@newfoundlandpower.com

T: (709)737-5209

F: (709)737-2926

Report Id: NEWSTJ [WCAMIS] 00954099 (Generated: 11/17/2023 07:39:28) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Shane Reid - NEWSTJ

 GRAPHS

Report Id: NEWSTJ [WCAMIS] 00954099 (Generated: 11/17/2023 07:39:30) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Shane Reid - NEWSTJ

Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.oilanalysis.net/CommonFiles/Reports/default/SR-GENERATE.php?ss=L-1259693-342495&lid=1259693&oem_template=WEARCHECK
http://www.tcpdf.org

	GENERAL ELECTRIC RBK-G1-UGBR/THBR\Bearing [WC549952] 07 Jun 2002 @ .0 hrs

