
Sample Rating Trend

DIRTOIL ANALYSIS REPORT

Machine Id

FORD CROWN VICTORIA
Component

Gasoline Engine
Fluid

{not provided} (5 QTS)

 DIAGNOSIS

Recommendation

We recommend that you drain the oil and perform a

filter service on this component if not already done.

We recommend an early resample to monitor this

condition.

Wear

All component wear rates are normal.

Contamination

Elemental level of silicon (Si) above normal

indicating ingress of seal material.

Fluid Condition

The oil viscosity appears lower than normal,

although there was not a reported oil type.

Report Id: ANNMIL [WUSCAR] 00287546 (Generated: 10/11/2023 14:43:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROB BOEHM - ANNMIL

 SAMPLE INFORMATION method limit/base current history1 history2

Sample Number Client Info WCM2021256 --- ---

Sample Date Client Info 29 Jul 2002 --- ---

Machine Age mls Client Info 0 --- ---

Oil Age mls Client Info 4970 --- ---

Oil Changed Client Info N/A --- ---

Sample Status SEVERE --- ---

 CONTAMINATION method limit/base current history1 history2

Fuel WC Method <1.0 --- ---

Glycol WC Method NEG --- ---

Page 1 of 2



OIL ANALYSIS REPORT

Laboratory : WearCheck USA - 501 Madison Ave., Cary, NC 27513

Sample No. : WCM2021256

Lab Number : 00287546

Unique Number : 1316031

Test Package : MOB 2

Received : 29 Jul 2002

Diagnosed : 31 Jul 2002

Diagnostician : 

To discuss this sample report, contact Customer Service at 1-800-237-1369.

* - Denotes test methods that are outside of the ISO 17025 scope of accreditation.

Statements of conformity to specifications are based on the simple acceptance decision rule (JCGM 106:2012)

ANNE ARUNDEL COUNTY

8435 MAXWELL FRYE RD

MILLERSVILLE, MD

US  21108

Contact: ROB BOEHM

pwboeh00@aacounty.org

T: (410)222-8020

F: (410)222-8026

Report Id: ANNMIL [WUSCAR] 00287546 (Generated: 10/11/2023 14:43:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROB BOEHM - ANNMIL

 GRAPHS

Report Id: ANNMIL [WUSCAR] 00287546 (Generated: 10/11/2023 14:43:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROB BOEHM - ANNMIL

Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.oilanalysis.net/CommonFiles/Reports/default/SR-GENERATE.php?ss=L-1316031-576968&lid=1316031&oem_template=WEARCHECK
http://www.tcpdf.org

	FORD FORD CROWN VICTORIA\Gasoline Engine [WCM2021256] 29 Jul 2002 @ .0 hrs

