
Sample Rating Trend

NORMALOIL ANALYSIS REPORT

Machine Id

HANSEN 1443-DT GEARBOX
Component

Gearbox
Fluid

 DIAGNOSIS

Recommendation

Resample at the next service interval to monitor.

Wear

All component wear rates are normal.

Contamination

There is no indication of any contamination in the

component.

Fluid Condition

The condition of oil is suitable for further service.

Report Id: CARWICKS [WUSCAR] 00412817 (Generated: 02/16/2024 12:49:26) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: GERRY THIBODEAU - CARWICKS

 SAMPLE INFORMATION method limit/base current history1 history2

Sample Number Client Info WCI006600 WCI006674 WCI2015608

Sample Date Client Info 06 Jan 2003 17 Dec 2002 02 Oct 2002

Machine Age mths Client Info 0 0 0

Oil Age mths Client Info 17 16 14

Oil Changed Client Info Not Changd Not Changd Not Changd

Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL

 CONTAMINATION method limit/base current history1 history2

Water WC Method NEG NEG NEG

 SAMPLE IMAGES method limit/base current history1 history2

Color no image no image no image

Bottom no image no image no image

Page 1 of 2



OIL ANALYSIS REPORT

Laboratory : WearCheck USA - 501 Madison Ave., Cary, NC 27513

Sample No. : WCI006600

Lab Number : 00412817

Unique Number : 1506140

Test Package : IND 2

Received : 13 Jan 2003

Tested : 14 Jan 2003

Diagnosed : 

To discuss this sample report, contact Customer Service at 1-800-237-1369.

* - Denotes test methods that are outside of the ISO 17025 scope of accreditation.

Statements of conformity to specifications are based on the simple acceptance decision rule (JCGM 106:2012)

CARGILL OILSEEDS-WICHITA

1408 N BARWISE

WICHITA, KS

US  67214

Contact: GERRY THIBODEAU

gerry_thibodeau@cargill.com

T: (316)292-2742

F: (316)292-2244

Report Id: CARWICKS [WUSCAR] 00412817 (Generated: 02/16/2024 12:49:26) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: GERRY THIBODEAU - CARWICKS

 GRAPHS

Report Id: CARWICKS [WUSCAR] 00412817 (Generated: 02/16/2024 12:49:30) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: GERRY THIBODEAU - CARWICKS

Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.oilanalysis.net/CommonFiles/Reports/default/SR-GENERATE.php?ss=L-1506140-590419&lid=1506140&oem_template=WEARCHECK
http://www.tcpdf.org

	HANSEN HANSEN 1443-DT GEARBOX\Gearbox [WCI006600] 06 Jan 2003 @ .0 hrs

