
Sample Rating Trend

NORMALFUEL REPORT

Area

X - Removed Equipment
Machine Id

NO UNIT
Component

Diesel Fuel
Fluid

{not provided} (--- LTR)

 DIAGNOSIS

Recommendation

This is a baseline read-out on the submitted

sample.

Contaminants

The water content is negligible. There is no Bacteria

and/or Yeast present in the sample.

Fuel Condition

Not enough sample submitted to determine fuel

condition and/or classification.

Report Id: GRIFFON [WCAMIS] 01600733 (Generated: 05/30/2024 09:14:02) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Laurie Bosley - GRIFFON

 SAMPLE INFORMATION method limit/base current history1 history2

Sample Number Client Info PP --- ---

Sample Date Client Info 06 Apr 2010 --- ---

Machine Age hrs Client Info 0 --- ---

Sample Status NORMAL --- ---

 CONTAMINANTS method limit/base current history1 history2

Water <0.05% ASTM D6304* 0.002 --- ---

ppm Water <500ppm ASTM D6304* 23.6 --- ---

 MICROBIAL method limit/base current history1 history2

Bacteria >=100000CFU/ml ASTM D6469* 0 --- ---

Yeast >=100000CFU/ml ASTM D6469* 0 --- ---

Mold MODERColonies ASTM D6469* NONE --- ---

 SAMPLE IMAGES method limit/base current history1 history2

Color no image no image no image

Bottom no image no image no image

Page 1 of 2



FUEL REPORT

Laboratory : WearCheck - C8-1175 Appleby Line, Burlington, ON L7L 5H9

Sample No. : PP

Lab Number : 01600733

Unique Number : 3090605

Test Package : TEST ( Additional Tests: Bacteria, KF )

Received : 07 Apr 2010

Tested : 09 Apr 2010

Diagnosed : 09 Apr 2010 - Kevin Marson

To discuss this sample report, contact Customer Service at 1-800-268-2131.

Test denoted (*) outside scope of accreditation, (m) method modified, (e) tested at external lab.

Validity of results and interpretation are based on the sample and information as supplied.

CANADIAN COAST GUARD

CCGS GRIFFON, PO BOX 1000, 401 KING ST.W

Prescott, ON

CA  K6V 5T3

Contact: Laurie Bosley

Laurie.Bosley@dfo-mpo.gc.ca

T: 

F: (519)383-1994

Report Id: GRIFFON [WCAMIS] 01600733 (Generated: 05/30/2024 09:14:02) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Laurie Bosley - GRIFFON

 GRAPHS

Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.oilanalysis.net/CommonFiles/Reports/default/SR-GENERATE.php?ss=L-3090605-2155587&lid=3090605&oem_template=WEARCHECK
http://www.tcpdf.org

	NO UNIT\Diesel Fuel [PP] 06 Apr 2010 @ .0 hrs

