
Sample Rating Trend

NORMALOIL ANALYSIS REPORT

Area

ERIC BEGIN
Machine Id

LIEBHERR LH30A LH30A2020
Component

Hydraulic System
Fluid

AW HYDRAULIC OIL ISO 32 (--- GAL)

 DIAGNOSIS

Recommendation

Échantillonner de nouveau l'équipement au
prochain intervalle de vidange afin d'en surveiller la
condition. Le fluide n’était pas spécifié, toutefois,
une comparaison avec d’autres fluides indiqu que
ce fluide est du (GENERIC) AW HYDRAULIC OIL
ISO 32. Veuillez confirmer. Veuillez communiquer
avec un représentant April Super Flo au sujet de
l'achat d'une trousse d'échantillonnage appropriée à
vos besoins. Notez:  nous recommandons
d’acheter les trousses MOB 2 pour cet
équipement, ce testkit inclut le Compte de Particule
pour déterminer la propreté ISO du liquide.

Wear

Les taux d'usure de tous les composants sont
normaux.

Contamination

Il n`y a aucune indication de contamination dans le
composant (non confirmée).

Fluid Condition

L'état de l'huile est acceptable pour la durée de
service.

Report Id: APRTRO [WCAMIS] 02562658 (Generated: 09/06/2023 08:42:34) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Nathaly April - APRTRO

 SAMPLE INFORMATION method limit/base current history1 history2

Sample Number Client Info ASF0560813 --- ---

Sample Date Client Info 02 Jun 2023 --- ---

Machine Age hrs Client Info 0 --- ---

Oil Age hrs Client Info 0 --- ---

Oil Changed Client Info N/A --- ---

Sample Status NORMAL --- ---

 WEAR METALS method limit/base current history1 history2

Iron >50ppm ASTM D5185(m) 34 --- ---

Chromium >5ppm ASTM D5185(m) 2 --- ---

Nickel >2ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 --- ---

Titanium ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 --- ---

Silver ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 --- ---

Aluminum >2ppm ASTM D5185(m) <1 --- ---

Lead >4ppm ASTM D5185(m) <1 --- ---

Copper >10ppm ASTM D5185(m) 4 --- ---

Tin >2ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 --- ---

Antimony >2ppm ASTM D5185(m) <1 --- ---

Vanadium ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 --- ---

Beryllium ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 --- ---

Cadmium ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 --- ---

 ADDITIVES method limit/base current history1 history2

Boron 5ppm ASTM D5185(m) <1 --- ---

Barium 5ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 --- ---

Molybdenum 5ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 --- ---

Manganese ppm ASTM D5185(m) <1 --- ---

Magnesium 25ppm ASTM D5185(m) <1 --- ---

Calcium 200ppm ASTM D5185(m) 206 --- ---

Phosphorus 300ppm ASTM D5185(m) 424 --- ---

Zinc 370ppm ASTM D5185(m) 492 --- ---

Sulfur 2500ppm ASTM D5185(m) 1267 --- ---

Lithium ppm ASTM D5185(m) <1 --- ---

 CONTAMINANTS method limit/base current history1 history2

Silicon >17ppm ASTM D5185(m) 2 --- ---

Sodium ppm ASTM D5185(m) 1 --- ---

Potassium >20ppm ASTM D5185(m) <1 --- ---

 VISUAL method limit/base current history1 history2

White Metal NONEscalar Visual* NONE --- ---

Yellow Metal NONEscalar Visual* NONE --- ---

Precipitate NONEscalar Visual* NONE --- ---

Silt NONEscalar Visual* NONE --- ---

Debris NONEscalar Visual* NONE --- ---

Sand/Dirt NONEscalar Visual* NONE --- ---

Appearance NORMLscalar Visual* NORML --- ---

Odor NORMLscalar Visual* NORML --- ---

Emulsified Water >0.1scalar Visual* NEG --- ---

Free Water scalar Visual* NEG --- ---

Page 1 of 2



OIL ANALYSIS REPORT

Laboratory : WearCheck - C8-1175 Appleby Line, Burlington, ON L7L 5H9
Sample No. : ASF0560813
Lab Number : 02562658
Unique Number : 5591699
Test Package : MOB 1

Received : 07 Jun 2023
Diagnosed : 07 Jun 2023
Diagnostician : Wes Davis

To discuss this sample report, contact Customer Service at 1-800-268-2131.

Test denoted (*) outside scope of accreditation, (m) method modified, (e) tested at external lab.

Validity of results and interpretation are based on the sample and information as supplied.

April Super Flo

9 rue Beland
L`Isle-Verte, QC

CA  G0L 1K0
Contact: Nathaly April

NAPRIL@APRILSUPERFLO.COM
T: (418)898-5151
F: (418)898-2192

Report Id: APRTRO [WCAMIS] 02562658 (Generated: 09/06/2023 08:42:34) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Nathaly April - APRTROReport Id: APRTRO [WCAMIS] 02562658 (Generated: 09/06/2023 08:42:34) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Nathaly April - APRTRO

 FLUID PROPERTIES method limit/base current history1 history2

Visc @ 40°C 32cSt ASTM D7279(m) 32.3 --- ---

 SAMPLE IMAGES method limit/base current history1 history2

Color no image no image no image

Bottom no image no image no image

 GRAPHS

Page 2 of 2
Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.oilanalysis.net/CommonFiles/Reports/default/SR-GENERATE.php?ss=L-5591699-4221298&lid=5591699&oem_template=WEARCHECK
http://www.tcpdf.org

	LIEBHERR LIEBHERR LH30A LH30A2020\Hydraulic System [ASF0560813] 02 Jun 2023 @ .0 hrs

