
Sample Rating Trend

WEAR PARTICLESOIL ANALYSIS REPORT

Machine Id

263214180103
Component

2 Filter
Fluid

ESSO TERESSO ISO 68 (--- LTR)

 DIAGNOSIS

Recommendation

Il serait justifié de procéder à une inspection afin de

déterminer la source de l`usure. Nous vous

recommandons d`échantillonner de nouveau dès

que possible afin de confirmer la situation.

Wear Particles

Le filtre contenait une concentration élevée de

particules de fatigue de roulement ferreuses et non

ferreuses. Les particules ferreuses ont été digérées

et analysées par spectroscopie ICP. Les alliages

les plus probables sont l'acier faiblement allié 51XX

(51XX), l'acier faiblement allié 61XX (61XX) et

l'acier faiblement allié 41XX (41XX).

Contaminants

Le filtre ne contenait que des niveaux normaux de

contaminants et débris. Tous les niveaux des

contaminants sont normaux

Report Id: ALCLAT [WCAMIS] 02580547 (Generated: 10/17/2023 11:10:33) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Sylvain Payer - ALCLAT

 SAMPLE INFORMATION method limit/base current history1 history2

Sample Number Client Info WC0803831 PP ---

Sample Date Client Info 30 Aug 2023 01 Oct 2020 ---

Machine Age yrs Client Info 0 0 ---

Oil Age yrs Client Info 0 0 ---

Oil Changed Client Info N/A N/A ---

Sample Status SEVERE NORMAL ---

 WEAR METALS method limit/base current history1 history2

Iron ppm ASTM D5185(m) 1212 2126 ---

Chromium ppm ASTM D5185(m) 10 3 ---

Nickel ppm ASTM D5185(m) <1 <1 ---

Titanium ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 1 ---

Silver ppm ASTM D5185(m) <1 0 ---

Aluminum ppm ASTM D5185(m) <1 5 ---

Lead ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 2 ---

Copper ppm ASTM D5185(m) 2 15 ---

Tin ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 6 ---

Antimony ppm ASTM D5185(m) <1 <1 ---

Vanadium ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 <1 ---

Beryllium ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 0 ---

Cadmium ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 <1 ---

 FERROGRAPHY method limit/base current history1 history2

Ferrous Rubbing Scale 0-10 ASTM  D7684* 3 3

Ferrous Sliding Scale 0-10 ASTM  D7684*

Ferrous Cutting Scale 0-10 ASTM  D7684*

Ferrous Rolling Scale 0-10 ASTM  D7684* 4 2

Ferrous Break-in Scale 0-10 ASTM  D7684*

Ferrous Spheres Scale 0-10 ASTM  D7684*

Ferrous Black Oxides Scale 0-10 ASTM  D7684* 1

Ferrous Red Oxides Scale 0-10 ASTM  D7684*

Ferrous Corrosive Scale 0-10 ASTM  D7684*

Ferrous Other Scale 0-10 ASTM  D7684* 1

Nonferrous Rubbing Scale 0-10 ASTM  D7684*

Nonferrous Sliding Scale 0-10 ASTM  D7684* 1

Nonferrous Cutting Scale 0-10 ASTM  D7684* 1

Nonferrous Rolling Scale 0-10 ASTM  D7684* 2

Nonferrous Other Scale 0-10 ASTM  D7684*

Sand/Dirt Scale 0-10 ASTM D7684* 1 1

Fibres Scale 0-10 ASTM  D7684* 1

Spheres Scale 0-10 ASTM  D7684*

Other Scale 0-10 ASTM  D7684* 2 2

Patch Weight mg ASTM  D7684* 85 17 ---

Page 1 of 4



OIL ANALYSIS REPORT

Laboratory : WearCheck - C8-1175 Appleby Line, Burlington, ON L7L 5H9

Sample No. : WC0803831

Lab Number : 02580547

Unique Number : 5633607

Test Package : TEST ( Additional Tests: Filter, ICP, ICP-DIGEST )

Received : 05 Sep 2023

Diagnosed : 18 Sep 2023

Diagnostician : Bill Quesnel

To discuss this sample report, contact Customer Service at 1-800-268-2131.

Test denoted (*) outside scope of accreditation, (m) method modified, (e) tested at external lab.

Validity of results and interpretation are based on the sample and information as supplied.

Rio Tinto Alcan (SECAL) USINE LATERRIERE

6301 BOUL. TALBOT

LATERRIERE, QC

CA  G0V 1K0

Contact: Sylvain Payer

sylvain.payer@riotinto.com

T: (418)818-9426

F: (418)678-1876

Report Id: ALCLAT [WCAMIS] 02580547 (Generated: 10/17/2023 11:10:33) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Sylvain Payer - ALCLATReport Id: ALCLAT [WCAMIS] 02580547 (Generated: 10/17/2023 11:10:33) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Sylvain Payer - ALCLAT

 ADDITIVES method limit/base current history1 history2

Boron 4.5ppm ASTM D5185(m) 2 7 ---

Barium 0.4ppm ASTM D5185(m) 2 0 ---

Molybdenum 0ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 0 ---

Manganese ppm ASTM D5185(m) 1 15 ---

Magnesium 0ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 3 ---

Calcium 0ppm ASTM D5185(m) 25 25 ---

Zinc 0ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 52 ---

Sulfur 1315ppm ASTM D5185(m) 54 38 ---

Lithium ppm ASTM D5185(m) <1 <1 ---

 CONTAMINANTS method limit/base current history1 history2

Silicon ppm ASTM D5185(m) 4 39 ---

Sodium ppm ASTM D5185(m) 66 70 ---

Potassium >20ppm ASTM D5185(m) 3 8 ---

 SAMPLE IMAGES method limit/base current history1 history2

Color no image no image no image

Bottom no image no image no image

 GRAPHS

Magn: 10x Illum: RW

0µ 1000µ

Magn: 10x Illum:   

0µ 1000µ

Magn: 60x Illum: RW

0µ 500µ

Page 2 of 4

http://www.oilanalysis.net/CommonFiles/Reports/default/SR-GENERATE.php?ss=L-5633607-3534421&lid=5633607&oem_template=WEARCHECK


FILTER REPORT

Machine Id

263214180103
Component

2 Filter
Fluid

ESSO TERESSO ISO 68 (--- LTR)

Magn: 10x Illum: RW

0µ 1000µ

Magn: 60x Illum: RW

0µ 500µ

Magn: 10x Illum:   

0µ 1000µ

 WEAR

Le filtre contenait une concentration

élevée de particules de fatigue de

roulement ferreuses et non ferreuses.

Les particules ferreuses ont été

digérées et analysées par

spectroscopie ICP. Les alliages les

plus probables sont l'acier faiblement

allié 51XX (51XX), l'acier faiblement

allié 61XX (61XX) et l'acier faiblement

allié 41XX (41XX).

 FERROGRAPHY method limit/base current history1 history2

Ferrous Rubbing Scale 0-10 ASTM  D7684* 3 3

Ferrous Sliding Scale 0-10 ASTM  D7684*

Ferrous Cutting Scale 0-10 ASTM  D7684*

Ferrous Rolling Scale 0-10 ASTM  D7684* 4 2

Ferrous Break-in Scale 0-10 ASTM  D7684*

Ferrous Spheres Scale 0-10 ASTM  D7684*

Ferrous Black Oxides Scale 0-10 ASTM  D7684* 1

Ferrous Red Oxides Scale 0-10 ASTM  D7684*

Ferrous Corrosive Scale 0-10 ASTM  D7684*

Ferrous Other Scale 0-10 ASTM  D7684* 1

Nonferrous Rubbing Scale 0-10 ASTM  D7684*

Nonferrous Sliding Scale 0-10 ASTM  D7684* 1

Nonferrous Cutting Scale 0-10 ASTM  D7684* 1

Nonferrous Rolling Scale 0-10 ASTM  D7684* 2

Nonferrous Other Scale 0-10 ASTM  D7684*

Sand/Dirt Scale 0-10 ASTM D7684* 1 1

Fibres Scale 0-10 ASTM  D7684* 1

Spheres Scale 0-10 ASTM  D7684*

Other Scale 0-10 ASTM  D7684* 2 2

Patch Weight mg ASTM  D7684* 85 17 ---

Report Id: ALCLAT [WCAMIS] 02580547 (Generated: 10/17/2023 11:10:34) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Sylvain Payer - ALCLAT

Page 3 of 4



This page left intentionally blank

Page 4 of 4

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	ATLAS COPCO 263214180103\2 Filter [WC0803831] 30 Aug 2023 @ .0 hrs
	ATLAS COPCO 263214180103\2 Filter [WC0803831] 30 Aug 2023 @ .0 hrs

