
Sample Rating Trend

NORMALOIL ANALYSIS REPORT

Area

(CFOWE) WESTJET
Machine Id

DHC8-Q400 PCE-FA1275
Component

Left Jet Turbine
Fluid

MOBIL JET OIL II (--- GAL)

 DIAGNOSIS

Recommendation

This is a baseline read-out on the submitted

sample.

Wear

{not applicable}

Contamination

{not applicable}

Fluid Condition

{not applicable}

Report Id: JDASSM [WCAMIS] 02587383 (Generated: 10/06/2023 11:59:54) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Julian Chin - JDASSM

 SAMPLE INFORMATION method limit/base current history1 history2

Sample Number Client Info WC0855577 WC0855582 WC0843063

Sample Date Client Info 03 Oct 2023 06 Sep 2023 10 Aug 2023

Machine Age hrs Client Info 0 0 0

Oil Age hrs Client Info 0 0 0

Oil Changed Client Info N/A N/A N/A

Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL

 FLUID DEGRADATION method limit/base current history1 history2

Acid Number (AN) 0.03mg KOH/g ASTM D974* 0.09 0.06 0.07

 VISUAL method limit/base current history1 history2

White Metal NONEscalar Visual* NONE NONE NONE

Yellow Metal NONEscalar Visual* NONE NONE NONE

Precipitate NONEscalar Visual* NONE VLITE NONE

Silt NONEscalar Visual* NONE NONE NONE

Debris NONEscalar Visual* NONE NONE NONE

Sand/Dirt NONEscalar Visual* NONE NONE NONE

Appearance NORMLscalar Visual* NORML NORML NORML

Odor NORMLscalar Visual* NORML NORML NORML

 SAMPLE IMAGES method limit/base current history1 history2

Color no image no image no image

Bottom no image no image no image

Page 1 of 2



OIL ANALYSIS REPORT

Laboratory : WearCheck - C8-1175 Appleby Line, Burlington, ON L7L 5H9

Sample No. : WC0855577

Lab Number : 02587383

Unique Number : 5656449

Test Package : TEST ( Additional Tests: Tan Auto, TAN Man )

Received : 05 Oct 2023

Diagnosed : 06 Oct 2023

Diagnostician : Kevin Marson

To discuss this sample report, contact Customer Service at 1-800-268-2131.

Test denoted (*) outside scope of accreditation, (m) method modified, (e) tested at external lab.

Validity of results and interpretation are based on the sample and information as supplied.

JD Aero Technical Inc

13-475 Airport Road

Sault Ste Marie, ON

CA  P6A 5K6

Contact: Julian Chin

jchin@jdaeromaintenance.com

T: (416)560-9976

F: (705)779-3250

Report Id: JDASSM [WCAMIS] 02587383 (Generated: 10/06/2023 11:59:55) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Julian Chin - JDASSM

 GRAPHS

Report Id: JDASSM [WCAMIS] 02587383 (Generated: 10/06/2023 12:00:00) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Julian Chin - JDASSM

Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.oilanalysis.net/CommonFiles/Reports/default/SR-GENERATE.php?ss=L-5656449-4246515&lid=5656449&oem_template=WEARCHECK
http://www.tcpdf.org

	DHC8-Q400 DHC8-Q400 PCE-FA1275\Left Jet Turbine [WC0855577] 03 Oct 2023 @ .0 hrs

