
Sample Rating Trend

NORMALOIL ANALYSIS REPORT

Machine Id

SOLAR WINDSOR SALT
Component

Turbine
Fluid

SUMMIT SH-32T (--- GAL)

 DIAGNOSIS

Recommendation

This is a baseline read-out on the submitted

sample.

Contamination

MPC (Membrane Patch Colorimetry) test indicates

acceptable levels of varnish present.

Report Id: CAN109HAM [WCAMIS] 02622892 (Generated: 03/18/2024 15:51:03) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Len MacDonald - CAN109HAM

 SAMPLE INFORMATION method limit/base current history1 history2

Sample Number Client Info WC0582415 --- ---

Sample Date Client Info 13 Mar 2024 --- ---

Machine Age hrs Client Info 6 --- ---

Oil Age hrs Client Info 0 --- ---

Oil Changed Client Info Filtered --- ---

Sample Status NORMAL --- ---

 CONTAMINATION method limit/base current history1 history2

Water >0.03WC Method NEG --- ---

 FLUID DEGRADATION method limit/base current history1 history2

MPC Varnish Potential >15Scale ASTM D7843(m)* 4 --- ---

 VISUAL method limit/base current history1 history2

White Metal NONEscalar Visual* NONE --- ---

Yellow Metal NONEscalar Visual* NONE --- ---

Precipitate NONEscalar Visual* NONE --- ---

Silt NONEscalar Visual* NONE --- ---

Debris NONEscalar Visual* NONE --- ---

Sand/Dirt NONEscalar Visual* NONE --- ---

Appearance NORMLscalar Visual* NORML --- ---

Odor NORMLscalar Visual* NORML --- ---

 SAMPLE IMAGES method limit/base current history1 history2

Color no image no image no image

Bottom no image no image no image

MPC no image no image no image

Page 1 of 2



MPC (Varnish Test) Sample Color & Clarity

Report Id: CAN109HAM [WCAMIS] 02622892 (Generated: 03/18/2024 15:51:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Len MacDonald - CAN109HAM

Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SOLAR SOLAR WINDSOR SALT\Turbine [WC0582415] 13 Mar 2024 @ 6.0 hrs

