
Sample Rating Trend

NORMALOIL ANALYSIS REPORT

Machine Id

SAW SAVE 100 (B2)
Component

Unknown Component
Fluid

{not provided} (--- GAL)

 DIAGNOSIS

Recommendation

This is a baseline read-out on the submitted

sample.

Fluid Condition

Pour Point = -36°C.

Report Id: IRV1169STJ [WCAMIS] 02625888 (Generated: 04/09/2024 13:42:34) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Blaine Sherwood - IRV1169STJ

 SAMPLE INFORMATION method limit/base current history1 history2

Sample Number Client Info PP --- ---

Sample Date Client Info 31 Mar 2024 --- ---

Machine Age hrs Client Info 0 --- ---

Oil Age hrs Client Info 0 --- ---

Oil Changed Client Info N/A --- ---

Sample Status NORMAL --- ---

 CONTAMINATION method limit/base current history1 history2

Water WC Method NEG --- ---

 VISUAL method limit/base current history1 history2

White Metal NONEscalar Visual* NONE --- ---

Yellow Metal NONEscalar Visual* NONE --- ---

Precipitate NONEscalar Visual* NONE --- ---

Silt NONEscalar Visual* NONE --- ---

Debris NONEscalar Visual* NONE --- ---

Sand/Dirt NONEscalar Visual* NONE --- ---

Appearance NORMLscalar Visual* NORML --- ---

Odor NORMLscalar Visual* NORML --- ---

 FLUID PROPERTIES method limit/base current history1 history2

Pour Point °C ASTM D97* -36 --- ---

 SAMPLE IMAGES method limit/base current history1 history2

Color no image no image no image

Bottom no image no image no image

Page 1 of 2



OIL ANALYSIS REPORT

Laboratory : WearCheck - C8-1175 Appleby Line, Burlington, ON L7L 5H9

Sample No. : PP

Lab Number : 02625888

Unique Number : 5759020

Test Package : TEST ( Additional Tests: PourPt )

Received : 01 Apr 2024

Tested : 09 Apr 2024

Diagnosed : 09 Apr 2024 - Kevin Marson

To discuss this sample report, contact Customer Service at 1-800-268-2131.

Test denoted (*) outside scope of accreditation, (m) method modified, (e) tested at external lab.

Validity of results and interpretation are based on the sample and information as supplied.

IRVING BLENDING & PACKAGING

P.O.BOX 1169, 555 COURTENAY CAUSEWAY

Saint John, NB

CA  E2L 4E6

Contact: Blaine Sherwood

Blaine.Sherwood@irvingoil.com

T: (506)202-7730

F: (506)632-7001

Report Id: IRV1169STJ [WCAMIS] 02625888 (Generated: 04/09/2024 13:42:34) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Blaine Sherwood - IRV1169STJ

 GRAPHS

Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.oilanalysis.net/CommonFiles/Reports/default/SR-GENERATE.php?ss=L-5759020-4401447&lid=5759020&oem_template=WEARCHECK
http://www.tcpdf.org

	SAW SAVE 100 (B2)\Unknown Component [PP] 31 Mar 2024 @ .0 hrs

