
UNKNOWNOIL ANALYSIS REPORT

Machine Id

BENCH TEST
Component

Hydraulic System
Fluid

AW HYDRAULIC OIL ISO 32 (800 LTR)

Report Id: HYDDOL [WCAMIS] 02626092 (Generated: 04/02/2024 16:16:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Francis Perron - HYDDOL

Sample is currently in the laboratory

Page 1 of 2



Sample is currently in the laboratory

Laboratory : WearCheck - C8-1175 Appleby Line, Burlington, ON L7L 5H9

Sample No. : ST45615

Lab Number : 02626092

Unique Number : 5759224

Test Package : IND 2

Received : 02 Apr 2024

Tested : 

Diagnosed : 

To discuss this sample report, contact Customer Service at 1-800-268-2131.

Test denoted (*) outside scope of accreditation, (m) method modified, (e) tested at external lab.

Validity of results and interpretation are based on the sample and information as supplied.

HYDROMEC INC

2921, BLVD WALLBERG

DOLBEAU, QC

CA  G8L 1L6

Contact: Francis Perron

hydraulique@hydromec.ca

T: 

F: (418)276-8166

Report Id: HYDDOL [WCAMIS] 02626092 (Generated: 04/02/2024 16:16:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Francis Perron - HYDDOL

Page 2 of 2
Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.oilanalysis.net/CommonFiles/Reports/default/SR-GENERATE.php?ss=L-5759224-2835105&lid=5759224&oem_template=WEARCHECK
http://www.tcpdf.org

	BENCH TEST\Hydraulic System [ST45615] 01 Apr 2024 @ .0 hrs

