
 - FRONT GASOLINE ENGINESample No: WC0933997
Oil Type: SAE 0W20

Dimitri Agaphonov1055 Alexis-NihonMontreal, QCCA  H4R 1S1Contact: Dimitri Agaphonovdagaph@hotmail.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.All componentwear rates are normal. There is amoderate amount of fuel present inthe oil. Tests confirm the presence offuel in the oil. The BN result indicatesthat there is suitable alkalinityremaining in the oil. Fuel is present inthe oil and is lowering the viscosity.The AN level is acceptable for thisfluid. The oil is no longer serviceabledue to the presence of contaminants.

Depot: DIMMONUnique No: 5763684Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 23 Apr 2024
Report Id: DIMMON [WCAMIS] 02630552 (Generated: 05/03/2024 10:32:51) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Dimitri Agaphonov - DIMMON

 SAMPLE INFORMATION
Sample Number WC0933997 --- --- ---Sample Date 15 Apr 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 37000 --- --- ---Oil Hours 13000 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION
Visc @ 100°C cSt 6.4 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 6.68 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 32 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION
Water % NEG --- --- ---Soot % % 0 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 40 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 39 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % 4.7 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 32 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS
Iron ppm 5 --- --- ---Copper ppm 4 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 6 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 78 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES
Calcium ppm 978 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 421 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 640 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 556 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 36 --- --- --- Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: DIMMON [WCAMIS] 02630552 (Generated: 05/03/2024 10:32:53) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Dimitri Agaphonov - DIMMON
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	TOYOTA \Front Gasoline Engine [WC0933997] 15 Apr 2024 @ 37000.0 hrs

