
2003 (S/N 64320700) - HYDRAULIC SYSTEMSample No: RP195165
Oil Type: MOBIL DTE 25

ADIENT1101 E 8TH STELDON, MOUS  65026Contact: RUSSELL COOKrussel.cook@adient.comT: (573)392-2741F: (573)392-5804
Diagnosis
We recommend you service the filterson this component. Resample at thenext service interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is a high amount ofparticulates present in the oil. The ANlevel is acceptable for this fluid. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: ADIELDUnique No: 8630864Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 17 Jun 2019
Report Id: ADIELD [WUSCAR] 04734085 (Generated: 04/23/2024 16:08:26) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RUSSELL COOK - ADIELD

 SAMPLE INFORMATION
Sample Number RP195165 RP181107 RP177901 RP176354Sample Date 05 Jun 2019 27 Jun 2018 07 Nov 2017 06 Nov 2017Machine Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed N/A N/A N/A N/ASample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITION
Visc @ 40°C cSt 43.5 43.64 37.6 43.97Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.520 0.451 0.623 0.358
 CONTAMINATION
Water % 0.008 0.008 0.005 0.004Particles >4µm 83921 11221 16775 14521Particles >6µm 33574 3277 5816 2894Particles >14µm 4785 281 787 215ISO 4406:1999 (c) 24/22/19 21/19/15 21/20/17 21/19/15Silicon ppm <1 0 <1 <1Sodium ppm 2 1 <1 1Potassium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1
 WEAR METALS
Iron ppm 2 <1 <1 <1Copper ppm 3 3 <1 4Lead ppm <1 0 0 <1Tin ppm 0 0 0 <1Aluminum ppm 0 0 0 0Chromium ppm 0 0 0 0Molybdenum ppm 0 <1 0 0Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 0 <1 0 0Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVES
Calcium ppm 108 95 83 88Magnesium ppm 2 <1 0 0Zinc ppm 450 431 598 449Phosphorus ppm 340 325 408 351Barium ppm 0 <1 0 0Boron ppm <1 <1 <1 <1

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: ADIELD [WUSCAR] 04734085 (Generated: 04/23/2024 16:08:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RUSSELL COOK - ADIELD
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	WERHEN BACK 2003 (S/N 64320700)\Hydraulic System [RP195165] 05 Jun 2019 @ .0 hrs

