
Sample Rating Trend

NORMALCOOLANT REPORT

Machine Id

1621001 - PINNACLE DTM ISO 680
Component

New (Unused) Oil
Fluid

{not provided} (--- GAL)

 DIAGNOSIS

Recommendation

All tests and evaluation performed at subcontracted

ISO 17025 laboratory. ASTM D130 Copper Strip

Corrosion: 1A for 3 hours at 212F (100C). ASTM

D1401 Water Separability: 42/37/2. Please note

that this is an updated copy for ASTM D93 PMCC

measured at 266.5C.

Report Id: PETGRAMI [WUSCAR] 05723603 (Generated: 10/09/2023 09:50:01) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: JAMES KRAFT - PETGRAMI

 SAMPLE INFORMATION method limit/base current history1 history2

Sample Number Client Info WC05723603 --- ---

Sample Date Client Info 20 Dec 2022 --- ---

Machine Age hrs Client Info 0 --- ---

Oil Age hrs Client Info 0 --- ---

Oil Changed Client Info N/A --- ---

Sample Status NORMAL --- ---

 VISUAL method limit/base current history1 history2

Color no image no image no image

Bottom no image no image no image

Page 1 of 2



COOLANT REPORT

Laboratory : WearCheck USA - 501 Madison Ave., Cary, NC 27513

Sample No. : WC05723603

Lab Number : 05723603

Unique Number : 10268184

Test Package : TEST ( Additional Tests: CC FLASH, COOL, KF )

Received : 21 Dec 2022

Diagnosed : 09 Jan 2023

Diagnostician : Doug Bogart

To discuss this sample report, contact Customer Service at 1-800-237-1369.

* - Denotes test methods that are outside of the ISO 17025 scope of accreditation.

Statements of conformity to specifications are based on the simple acceptance decision rule (JCGM 106:2012)

PETROLEUM TECHNOLOGIES GROUP

4665 BROADMOOR AVE, SUITE 150

GRAND RAPIDS, MI

US  49512

Contact: JAMES KRAFT

james@oil-lab.com

T: (616)698-9399

F: 

Report Id: PETGRAMI [WUSCAR] 05723603 (Generated: 10/09/2023 09:50:01) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: JAMES KRAFT - PETGRAMI

 GRAPHS

Report Id: PETGRAMI [WUSCAR] 05723603 (Generated: 10/09/2023 09:50:02) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: JAMES KRAFT - PETGRAMI

Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.oilanalysis.net/CommonFiles/Reports/default/SR-GENERATE.php?ss=L-10268184-4144727&lid=10268184&oem_template=WEARCHECK
http://www.tcpdf.org

	1621001 - PINNACLE DTM ISO 680\New (Unused) Oil [WC05723603] 20 Dec 2022 @ .0 hrs

